
CHAPTER 27-GOVERNMENT INTERESTS IN PATENTS

EXECUTIVE ORDER NO. 9424

Feb. 18, 1944, 9 F.R. 1959

ESTABLISHMENT OF A REGISTER OF GOVERNMENT INTERESTS IN PATENTS

t1bHe'c!U.,lv. ([l,.Ii, I;" b.,I., Wel'l '" ,"tli
cases as he shall·detertntne and proclaim it to
be inconsistent with the pul;ll!c interest to
issue such licenses on a nonexclusive royalty
free basis.

5. The Department of State, in consulta­
tion with the Chairman of Government Pat­
ents .Board [now Secretary of Commerce].
Shall negotiate arrangements among govern­
ments under which each government and its
nationals shall have access to the foreign
patents of the other participating govern­
ments. Patents relating to matters of public
health may be licensed by the Chairman of
Government Patents Board [now Secretary of
Commerce], with the approval of the Secre­
tary of State, to any country or its nationals
upon such terms and conditions as are in
accordance with law and as the Chairman of
Government Patents Board [now Secretary of
Commerce] determines to. be appropriate, re­
gardless of whether such.country is a party to
the arrangements provided for in this section.

6. There shall be exempted from the pro­
visions of this order (a) all inventions within
the jurisdiction of the Atomic Energy Com­
mission except in such cases as the said Com­
mission specifically authorizes the inclusion
of an invention under the terms of this order;
and (b) all other inventions officially classi­
fied as secret or confidential for reasons of the
national security. Nothing in this order shall
supersede the declassification policies and
procedures established by Executive Orders
Nos. 9568 of June 8, 1945, 9604 of August
25, 1945, and 9809 of December 12, 1946.

Transfer of Functions. The Atomic Ener­
gy Commission was abolished and all func­
tions were transferred to the Administrator of
the Energy Research and Development Ad­
ministration (unless otherwise specifically
provided) by section 5814 of Title 42, The
Public Health and Welfare. The Energy Re­
search and Development Administration wa...
terminated and functions vested by law in the
Administrator thereof were transferred to the
Secretary of Energy (unless otherwise specifi­
cal1yprovided) by sections 7151(a) and 7293
of Title 42.

, ,-
2. All Government deparlmentsl'l:t1d

agencies which have or may hereafter acquire
title to inventions or the right to file patent
applications abroad thereon, shall fully and
continuously inform the Chairman of Gov­
ernment Patents Board [now Secretary of
Commerce: See Ex.Ord. No. 10930 set out
as a note below] concerning such inventions,
except as provided. in section 6 hereof, and
shalt make recommendations to the Chairman
of Government Patents Board [now Secretary
of Commerce] as-to which of such inventions
should receive patent protection by the Unit­
ed States abroad and the foreign jurisdictions
in which such patent protection should be
sought. The recommendations of such de­
partments and agencies shall indicate the im­
mediate or future industrial, commercial or
other value of the invention concerned, in­
eluding its value to public health.

3. The Chairman of Government Patents
Board [now Secretary, of Commerce] shall
determine whether, and in what foreign juris­
dictions, the United States should seek pat­
ents for such inventions, and, to the extent of
appropriations available therefor, shall pro­
Cure patent protection for such inventions,
taking al1 action, consistent with existing law,
necessary to acquire and maintain patent
rights abroad. Such determinations of the
said Department shall be made after fult con­
sultation with United States industry and
commerce, with the- Department of State, and
with other Government agencies familiar with
the technical, scientific, industrial, commer­
cial or other economic or social factors affect­
ing the invention involved, and after consider.
ation of theavailabitity of valid patent
protection in the countries determined to be
immediate or potential markets for, or pro­
ducers of, products, processes, or services
covered by or relating to . the invention.

4. The Chairman. of Government Patents
Board [now Secretary of Commerce] shall
administer foreign patents acquired by the
United States under the terms of this order
and shall issue licenses thereunder in accor­
dance with law under such rules and regula­
tions as he shall prescribe. Nationals of the
United States shall be granted licenses on a

EXECUTIVE ORDER NO. 10096

Jan. 23, 1950,'15 F,R. 389, as amended by Ex.Ord. No. 10695, Jan. 17, 1957,
22 F.R. 365; Ex.Ord. No. 10930, Mar. 27, 1961, 26 F.R. 2583

UNIFORM GOVERNMENT· PATENT POLICY FOR INVENTIONS
BY GOVERNMENT EMPLOYEES

NOW, THEREFORE, by virtue of the au- and Commander in Chief of the armed forces
thority vested in me by the Constitution and of the United States, in the interest of the
statutes, and as President of the United States establishment and operationof a uniform pat-
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not prejudice in any way the assertion of such
right or interest by the Government.

3. The registershall be open to inspection
except as to such entries or documents which.
in the opinion of the department or agenq
submitting them for recording, should be
maintained in secrecy: Provided, however,
That the right of inspection may be restricted
to authorized representatives of the Govern­
ment pending the final report to the President
by the National Patent Planning Commission
under Executive Order No. 8917 of Decem­
ber 12, 1941, and action thereon by the Presi­
dent.

4. The Commissioner of Patents [now
Patents and Trademarks]. with the approval
of the Secretary of Commerce, shall prescribe
such rules and regulations as he may deem
necessary to effectuate the purposes of this
order.

after July 24, 1965, sec section 7(8) of Pub.L.
89-83, set out as a note under section 41 or
this title.

Historical Note

Repealed. Pub.L. 89-83, § 8, July 24, 1965, 79 Stat.
261]

1. The Secretary of Commerce shall cause
to be established in the United States Patent
Offic:e [now Patent and Trademark Office) 8

separate reaister for the recordlna of atl nahts
and Interests of the Government In or under
patents and applications for patents.

2. The several departments and other ex­
ecutive agencies of the Government, including
Government-owned or Government-can­
trolled 'corporations, shan forward promptly
to the Commissioner of Patents [now Patents
and Trademarks] for recording in the sepa­
rate register provided for in paragraph 1 here­
of all licenses, assignments, or other interests
of the Government in or under patents or
applications for patents, in accordance with
such rules and reaulations as may be pre­
scribed pursuant to paragraph 4 hereof; but
the lack of recordation in such register of any
right or interest of the Government in or
under any patent or application therefor shall

Repealed.]
Time for taking action in Government applications.

Historical Note
1965 Amendment. Pub.L. 89-83. § 8, July "Issue of patents without fees to Government

24, 1965, 79 Stat. 261, struck out item 266 employees",

EXECUTIVE ORDER ND. 9185

lune 16, 1947, 12 F.R. 3907, as amended by Bx.Ord. No. 10096,
Ian. 23, 1950, 15 F.R. 389 .

PATENT PROTECTION ABROAD OF INVENTIONS RESULTING FROM
RESEARCH FINANCED BY THE GOVERNMENT

1. All Government departments and inventions resulting from research conducted
agencies shan. whenever practicable, acquire or financed by the. Government.
the right to me, foreign patent applications on
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Section, Act July 19, 1952, c. 950: § I, 66
Stat. 811. provided for the issuance of patents
to government employees without fees.

Effectl.. Pate of Repeal. Repeal or sec­
tion by Pub.L. 89-83 effective three months

sec.
[266.
267.

[§ 266.

.:»



- --------:

Transfer of Functions. The Atomic Ener­
gy Commission was abolished and all func­
tions were transferred to the Administrator of
the Energy Research and Development Ad­
ministration (unless otherwise specifically
provided) by section 5814 of Title 42. The
Public Health and Welfare, The Energy'Re­
search and Development Administration was
terminated and functions vested by law in the
Administrator thereof were transferred to the
Secretary of Energy (unless otherwise specifi­
cally provided) by sections 7151(a) and 7293
of Title 42.

(c) "Invention" includes any art. machine.
manufacture. design. or composition of mat­
ter. or any new and useful improvement
thereof. or any variety of plant. which is or
may be patentable under the patent laws of
the United States.

~) "Government employee" includes any
officer or employee. civilian or military. or
any Government agency. except such pert­
time consultants or employees as may be
excluded by regulations promulgated pursu­
ant to paragraph 4(b) hereof.

(a) "Government agency" includes any ex­
ecutive department and any independent
commission. board, office. agency. authority.
or other establishment of the Executive
Branch of the Government of the United
States (including any such independent regu­
latory commission or board. uny such wholly­
owned' corporation. and the Smithsonian In­
stitution). but excludes the Atomic Energy
Commission.

7. As used in this Executive Order. the
next stated terms. in singular and plural. are
defined as follows for the purposes hereof:

6. Each Government agency shall take all
steps appropriate to effectuate this order. in­
cluding the promulgation of necessary regula­
tions which shall not be inconsistent with this
order or with regulations issued pursuant to
paragraph' 4(b) hereof.

Htlll 1111 II

Commerce Utldet lhe vwvlsltdts bt ExecU/lye
Order No. 9865 of June 14. 1947 are hereby
transferred to the Chairman and the whole or
any part of such functions and duties may be
delegated by him to any Government agency
or officer: Provided, that said Executive Or­
der No. 9865 shall not be deemed to be
amended or affected by any provision of this
Executive order other than this paragraph 5.
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(b) The Government Patents Beard shaH
advise and confer with the Chairman con­
cerning the operation of those aspects of the
Government's patent policy which are affect­
ed by the provisions of this order or of Execu­
tive Order No. 9865. and suggest modifica­
tions or improvements where necessary.

(c) [Revoked. Ex.Ord, No. 10930. Mar.
27, 1961, 26 F.R. 2583J

(d) The Chairman [now Secretary of Com­
merce] shall establish such committees and
other working groups as may be required to
advise or assist him in the performance of any
eX his functions.

(e) The Chairman of the Government Pat­
ents Board [now Secretary of Commerce] and
the Chairman of the Interdepartmental Com­
mittee on Scientific Research and Develop­
ment (provided for by Executive Order No.
9912 of December 24. 1947), shall establish
and maintain such mutual consultation as
will effect the proper coordination of affairs
of common concern.

4. With a view to obtaining uniform ap­
plication of the policies set out in this order
and uniform operations thereunder. the
Chairman [now Secretary of Commerce] is
authorized and directed:

(a) To consult and advise with Govern­
ment agencies concerning the application and
operation of the policies outlined herein;

(b) After consultation with the Govern­
ment Patents Board. to formulate and submit
to the President for approval such proposed
rules and regulations as may be necessary or
desirable to implement and effectuate the
aforesaid policies. together with the recom­
mendations of the Government Patents Board
thereon;

(c) To submit annually a report to the
President 'concerning the operation of such
policies. and from time, to time such recom­
mendations for modification thereof as may
be deemed desirable; ,

(d) To determine with, finality any centro­
versies or disputes between any Government
agency and its employees. to the extent sub­
mitted by any party to the dispute. concern­
ing the ownership of inventions made by such
employees or rights therein; and

(e) To perform such other or further func­
tions or duties as may from time to, time be
prescribed by the President or by statute,

5. The functions and duties of the Secre­
tary of Commerce and the Department of

of employees specified by regulations issued
pursuant to section 4(b) hereof. falls within
the provisions of paragraph (a). above. and it
shall be presumed that any invention made by
any other employee faits within the provisions
of paragraph (b). above. Either presumption
may be rebutted by the facts or circumstances
attendant upon the conditions under which
any particular invention is made and. not­
withstanding the foregoing, shall not preclude
a determination that the invention falls within
the provisions of paragraph (d) next below.

(d) In any case wherein the Government
neither (1) pursuant to the provisions of para'
graph (a) above. obtains entire right. title and
interest in and to an invention nor (2) purse­
ant to the provisions of paragraph (b) above.
reserves a nonexclusive, irrevocable, royalty.
free license in the invention with power to
grant licenses for a1l governmental purposes.
the Government shan leave the entire right,
title and interest in and to the invention in
the Government employee" subject to law.

(e) Actions taken" and rights acquired, un­
.der the foregoing provisions of this section,
shall be reported to the Chairman (now Sec­
retary of Commerce] in accordance with pro­
cedures established by him.

2. Subject to considerations of national
security, or public health, safety. or welfare.
the following basic policy is established for
the collection. and dissemination to the pub­
lic. of information concerning inventions re­
sulting from Government research and devel­
opment activities:

(a) When an invention is made under cir­
cumstances defined in paragraph I(a) of this
order giving the United States the right to
title thereto, the Government agency con­
cerned, shall either prepare and file' an appli­
cation for patent therefor in the United States
Patent Office {now Patent and Trademark
Office] or make a full disclosure of the lnven­
tion promptly to the Chairman [now .Secre­
tary of Commerce]. who may. if he deter­
mines the Government interest SO requires.
cause application for patent to be filed or
cause the invention to be fully disclosed by
publication thereof: Provided. however. That.
consistent with present practice of the De­
partment of, Agriculture, no application for
patent shall, without. the approval of the Sec­
retary of Agriculture, be filed in respect of
any variety of plant invented by any employee
of that Department.

(b) [Revoked. Ex.Ord, No. 10695, Jan.
17, 1957, 22 F.R. 365J

Sec. 3. (a) [Revoked, Ex.Ord. No.
10930, Mar. 27, 1961, 26 F.R. 2583J
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(c) In applying the provrstons of
paragraphs (a) and (b). above. to the facts
and circumstances relating to the makirig of
any particular invention, it shan be presumed
that an invention made by an employee who
is employed or assigned (i) to invent or lm­
prove or perfect any art. machine. manufac­
ture, or composition of matter. (ii) to conduct
or perform research. development work, or
both. (iii)' to supervise. direct. coordinate. or
review Government financed or conducted
research. 'development work, or both. or (iv)
to act in a liaison capacity among governmen­
tal" or nongovernmental agencies or individu­
als engaged, in such work, or made by an
employee included within any' other category

-":"',", ~ ....
_..aled

ent policy' for the Government with respect to
inventions made by Government employees.
it is hereby ordered as follows:

1. The following basic policy is estab­
lished for al] Government agencies with re­
spect to inventions hereafter made by any
Government employee:

(I) The Government shall obtain the entire
righi, title and interest in and to all inven­
tions made by any Government employee (1)
during working hours, or (2) with a contribu­
tion by the Government of facilities, equip­
ment, materials" funds, or information, or of
time or services of other Government employ­
ees on official duty. or (3) which bear a direct
relation to or are made in consequence of the
official duties of the inventor,

(b) In any case where the contribution of
the Government, as measured by anyone or
more of the criteria set forth ift paragraph, (a)
last above, to the invention is insufficient
equitably to justify a requirement of assign­
ment to the Government of the entire right.
title and interest to such invention, or in any
case where the Government has insufficient
interest in an invention to obtain entire right,
title and interest therein (although the Gov­
ernment could obtain some under paragraph
(a), above), the Government agency con­
cerned, subject to the approval of the Chair­
man of the Government Patents Board [now
Secretary of Commerce. See Bx.Ord. No,
t0930 set out as a notebetow] (provided for
in paragraph 3 of this order and hereinafter
referred to as the Chairman), shall leave title
to such invention. in the employee. subject,
however; to the reservation to the Govern­
ment of a nonexclusive, irrevocable, royalty­
free license in the invention with power to
grant licenses for all governmental purposes,
such reservation, in the terms thereof. to
appear. where practicable, in any patent, do­
mestic or foreign, which may issue on such
invention.




